ORDINANCE 0-14-06

AN ORDINANCE OF THE MAYOR AND COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
BISBEE, COUNTY OF COCHISE, STATE OF ARIZONA, AMENDING
THE APPLICABLE BUILDING AND SAFETY CODES, ARTICLES 7.1
THROUGH 77 OF THE CITY CODE, ADOPTING THESE
AMENDMENTS BY REFERENCE, AND PROVIDING FOR REPEAL
AND SEVERABILITY.

WHEREAS, the Mayor and City Council have the authority fo adopt and to amend, by
ordinance, building and safety codes of the City of Bisbee; and

WHEREAS the International Code Council has developed a comprehensive set of
building and safety codes that are now in use in all fifty states and have become w1dely accepted_
in Arizona; ificluding Cochise County; and }

WHEREAS, the City of Bisbee had not updated or revised its building and safety codes
significantly since the 1990’s, until the current International Codes were recently adopted
pursuant to Ordinance O-14-04; and

WHEREAS, other local jurisdictions have adopted various specific amendments to
these Codes to adapt them to the specific conditions and circumstances in these jurisdictions; and

WHEREAS, the attached “City of Bisbee Amendments to the Designated Building and .
Safety Codes,” incorporated herein by reference to the attached document, are intended to
become applicable at the same time that these Codes become applicable, in August, 2014; and

WHEREAS, it is in the best interests of the City of Bisbee and its citizens to adopt these
specific amendments,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the Council of the City of Bisbee as
follows: :

Section 1: That the City Code of the City of Bisbee, Articles 7.1 through 7.7, is
hereby amended as stated in the attached Exhibit A, “City of Bisbee Amendments to the
Designated Building and Safety Codes,” incorporated herein by reference.

Section 2: Adoption by Reference. That these Amendments are adopted with -
reference to the applicable Codes, ‘which are on file with the City of Bisbee and have been
previously. adopted by reference. The attached “City of Bisbee Amendments to the DeSIgllated"-
Building and Safety Codes” is also on file with the City of Bisbee and is hereby adopted, in the
same manner, by reference to this compilation of amendments.

Section 3: Repeal. All prior resolutions, ordinances, and policies are hereby
repealed to the extent of any conflict with this Ordinance.




Section 4: Severablhty If any section, subsection, sentence clause, phrase, or < . - -

portion of thls Ordinance is for any reason held to be invalid ‘of unconstitutional by the decisior
“of any coutt of competent Jurlsdlctlon such decision shall not affect the vahdlty of the ‘remainir "g L
‘ portlons o

“Section S:- Delayed Effective Date. In order to prov1de sufﬁment time for the-
transition to thése new Codes, this Ordinance shall first become effective on August 4, 2014, and'l o
shall remain in effect thereafter un‘nl amended or rescinded. ’

PASSED, APPROVED AND ADOPTED by the Mayor and Council of the Clty of T
Bisbee, this 1st day of July, 2014.

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Tobp Al MacKmnon City Atto%\



EXHIBIT A
CITY OF BISBEE AMENDMENTS
TO THE DESIGNATED BUILDING AND SAFETY CODES

AMENDMENTS TO THE CITY CODE OF THE CITY OF BISBEE
ARTICLE 7. 1, BUILDING CODES, THROUGH ARTICLE 7.7, BUILDING

CONSERVATION CODE
New lapgu_age
“"CHAPTER7 ~ BUILDING
ARTICLE 7.1 BUILDING CODES

(0-94-33; Ra94-50' 0-90-33; R-90-29; 0:96-40)

744 Adoptlon of Codes and Specmcatlon of Desrgn Criteria.
(0-03-03)

" The 2012 International Building Code, the 2012 International Existing Building Code, and the 2012
International Residential Code, including all tables and appendixes, are hereby adopted for use-in this
jufisdiction, except as specifically amended or excluded by the-amendments specified in this City
-Code For purposes of each of the desrqnated Codes adopted |n thrs Chapter 7 of the C|tv Code the,

) as the Code of the Cltv of Bisbee. The Buddmg Inspector of the Cltv of Blsbee or his: desmnee, s
authorlzed to assume all of the responsibilities and authontres of the “building official,” as that
term is used in these respective Codes. :

TA1A. Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria (all applicable Codes). -
Wind Speed . 90 mpj
Ground Snow Load _ . 20 psf
Topographic Effects . No
Seismic Design - « Category B
Weathering. . . ) ‘Moderate
Frost Llne Depth 12incheés
Térmite-' . Hea_v,y_to. Very Heavy
Winter. Deslqn Temperature . 18 20 degrees F
Flood Hazards . ' See Cochrse County Flood Control including new

panels as adopted




7.1.1.B. City of Bisbee Amendments to the 2012 Edition of the International Building Code.

1, At Section 101.2, insert Exceptron 2 to read: “Existing buildings undergoing . repair;-
alterations or - addltlons and - change of occupancy shall be permltted to . comply with the_
international Existing Building Code.”

2. At Section 103.2, insert a reference to the adopted Building Permlt Fees schedule of the
City Code for the appllcable fee schedule.

3. At Section 103.3, insert a reference to the permit fee refund authority included with the
adopted Building Permit Fee schedule of the City Code.

4. At Section 40633 change the first paragraph to read: “Carports of combustible
construction and garages shall comply with the provisions of this section for_separation and .

opening protectlon Carport and qrade floor surfaces shall be of approved ‘noncombustible”

material.”

5. At Section 406.3.4(1), change all references from “1/2 —inch qvpsum board” to .“5/8 ~inch
“Type. X' qvpsum board.”.Revise the second paraqraph to read: “For qarages beneath. habitable
rooms, "cover above by riot léss than two layers of 5/8 <irich Tvpe X qypsum board.” At the end of -
this section, insert: “Windows are fiot: permltted in the separatlon wall. All walls supporting the f|re
resrstance rated ceiling shall be protected with 5/8 —inch Type ‘X' gypsum board.”

6. . At Section 406.3.4(3), Add: “Refer to Section 714 for protection of other through or -
membrane penetrations.” '

7. . At Section 406.3.4, Add subsection 406.3.4(4): “Attlc access opening. The attlc access
opemnq protection suppotts shall be of noncombustible material.”

8. At Section 708.1, Add number 6, to read: “Walls separating tenant spaces.”

9. At Section 903.2.1.3(2), change “300” to “100 or more.” -

10. . At Section 903.2.3, insert a new item 3 as a new required area: “Where Group E fire area has
-an occupant load of 30 or more.” '

11. At Section 1006.3, insert a new number 7 to read: “Interior electrical service rooms.”

12. At: Section 1009.9.3, in the exceptlon change reference to “1/2 —inch” to read: “5/8 —rnch
Type X.”

13. At Table 2304.9.1, insert #35 —connection: “Story-to-story tie at 48” o.c. by minimum. 18~<
qauge strap with minimum 9” lap on studs Fastenmg per schedule in manufacture s mstallatlon P
mstructlons or contintous sheathmq with minimum 9”lap on studs o




14, At Section 2902.2; Insert a new Exception No. 4 to read: “In exrstrng burlqu occupancres
one publrc/employee restrodm is allowed where the occupant load ‘does ‘not exceed 50 for other -
than M occupanmes .and for M occupancres where the occupant load does not exceed 100;
provrded that the one restroom for ali such i occupanc|es is code complrant with ICC'A117.1 - 2009,

Where it is riot technlcallLfeasrble to- comply with the new construction standards the above shall o

conform to the requrrements to the'r maxrmum extend feasrble S

15. At Section 3109, change the requrred height of the required barrier or fénce from “4. fest” 0 or ..
“48 inches” to “5 feet” or “60 inches,” as applrcable Enclosire’ requrrements shall be not less than

those regmred by: applrcable state law

16. ___Appendices C E; F, and Gare adopted Appendrces A B D HIJ KL and M -are not-
dopted ' ’

1.44.C. City of Bisbee Amendmenits to the 2012 Editior of the | International Existiriq Building Code. ™~

1. ‘At Section 103.2, insert a reférence to the Building Permit Fees schedule of the City Code
for the applrcable fee schedule

2. At Section 103. 3, insert a réference to the permit fee refund authorrty included wrth the

'Burldrnq Permrt Fee schedule of the City Code.

3. At Sectlon 609.2, delete the exception. Water conservatron requirements are apglrcable to
new frxtures ‘

4. - At Sectron 805.4.4, change to read: “Doors servrng a Group H occupancv and all other
occupancy groups ‘not covered by item 2 in Section 1008.1.9. 3, serving .frooms or spaces ‘with-an-

occupant foad of 50 or mére, shall ot be provided with a latch or lock unless it is pamc release o

hardware, suitable for a frre exit.”

5. At Sectron 1010.3, insert at the end of the paraqraph “, . . International Plumbrnq Code and -

Building Code Bishée' Cltv Code, and comply with City of Brsbee standards.”

6. . Appendices A, B, and C are adopted. Resource A is .included as a source material in this
Code. ' ' '

7.11.0. 'Citv of Bisbee Amendments fo the 2012 Edition of the International Reslden‘tlal,COde.

1. At Section R103.2, insert a reference to the Building Permrt Fees schedule of the City. Codei.-”f' .

for the applrcable fee schedule.

2 At Section R103.3, ‘insert a reference to the permit fee refund authorrtv mcluded with’ the' |
Burldlng Permlt Fee schedule of the City: Code _ N

3. At Section R105.2.1 change “200 square feet” to “120 sauare feet *




4, Add a new. Sectlon R105.2.4 “Ordinary Repairs,” to read: “Ordmarv repairs which .involve

only the replacement of component parts of exrstmq work with similar parts or materrals and dofigt .

exceed $1000 in valuation (materlals and-labor at market value) and do not chanqe any structuial, -
electrical, mechanical, plumbing, or fire safety condition. Ordinary repairs are subject to thie -
provisions of R105.2.2.”

5. At Section R105.2(6), amend to read: “Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, and similar finish
work.”

6. At Section 106.3.1, change the stamp- Ianquaqe to read “Approval and date ~ CITY. OF -
BISBEE.” g

7. . AtTable R302.6, change the three references from “1/2 - inch gypsum board” to “5/8 — inch

_ Type X gypsum board or equivalent.” Chanqe the one reference from “5/8 |nch Typ_e )_(;gyps“um o

board” to “Two layers of 5/8 - inch Tvpe X gypsum board or.equivalent.”

8. At Sectron R302.6, insert subsection R302.6.1, as follows: “Attic access opening. The attrc
access openmg protection supports shail- be of noncombustlble material.” ‘

'9.-» At Sectlon R309 insert the words “or carport of combustlble construction” after” all

references to qarage (Requires fire separatron from carport )

10. __ Delete Section R309.5 regarding fire sprinklers, per Arizona law.

11. . At Section R313; delete- mandatory language. Add the following: Fire sprinklers are :not
requrred where the implementation of any:such Code prowsron IS prohlblted by Arizona law. They'
‘may'be an appropriate form of optional fire protection.

12. At Section R314.4, insert the following after thesecond sentence: “Smoke alarms shall not-
be installed on a dedicated circuit and shall originaté from a general-purpose branch circuit.”

13. At Section R602.3, insert at the end of the first paragraph: “In multi-story structures floor
ties shall be provided at 48” o.c. or wood structural panels shall be installed with a minimum of a. 9", _
overlap of both floor studs.”

14. At Sectlon R606.11, change beginning to read “Masonry walls shall be réinforced and -
anchored ‘

15. At Figure R60611(2) retitle to read: “Requirements _for Reinforced Grouted Masonry
Construction in Seismic Desmn Cateqory B,” and change the following: change #4 bars at “10_ft.

0.¢.” to’ “#4 bars at 4 o.c.”; add one 2" bar @ top of foundation: add two 5" bars (a') bottom of o

foundatron “4dd one %" bar @ top of wall ‘add one ‘/z” bar: @ roof connectron

16. At Section R606.12.2.3.3; end of first paragraph, chanqe to read: “ . . and at a maximum "
spacing of 4 feet.”




17. At Table 1101.10 - Clrmate Zones City of Brsbee requrrements shall be not less than those‘

19. At Sectron P2801 5.1, Pan- Size.and Drain. Add the followmq at the end. of the séc o
:sentence “A:drain shall: not be. requr_red for. replacement water heaters m locatrons where no,"'i, -

requrred for Zone 1 for all purposes

18. . At Section N1103 4.2, chanqe to read: “Refer to the City Co‘de Section 7.2.3 (R-4 minimumﬂ .

previously: installed: dram is- avallable

20. At Sectron P29041 1 Reqmred Sprmkler Locatrons Delete the frrst sentence and replace |t o

.for voluntarv mstallatrons or to allow for a f|re separatron reductron pursuant to sectrons R302 2' .

and R302 2 2.”

21 At Section P3009, .Gray Water. Recvclmq Systems, »delete Sectlons 300911 Dra|n and;;; e

3009 14 Landscaplnq and all’ references to those sectlons

22. At Sectron P3201 .2, change the Exception to read: “Traps for floor drains shall be frtted-

with a trap primer.”

' 23, At Séction E3601.6.2, chanaet:he first séntence to read: “Service dl"s"cOnnectrnqmeansand".'7 W
risers shall e surface mounted and provrded on the outS|de of the structure A recessed’ servrce :

entry is not permltted »o

24, . At Sectlon E3608.1, insert ‘a:second patagraph to read: “All accessory structures with. 2

poured foundation require the installation of. a concrete-encased electrode as requrred bv Section -

: E3608 1.2

25. At Section E3902.5, chanqe‘ to read: “. receptacles installed in ground level rooms and{-
unfinished basements shall have . ..” and “For purposes of this section, ground level rooms and
unfmlshed basements are defmed ‘

-26 At Section E4003.12, chanqe the section title to read: “Luminaries in Clothes. Closet‘s‘f‘-

Pantries, and: Storaqe ‘Rooms.” (All reference in thls ‘section to closet or clothes closet shall apply .
to clothes closets pantrles and storaqe rooms.)

21. At Sectron AG105.2(1), chanqe to read: “The top of the barrier shall be at least 60 |nches"_ _

, above qrade

28, Appendrces A/B.C D.E G J K and M are adopted Appendrces F, H, I and L are. not'__

' do ted



7.1.2 Condition Precedent to Issuance of Building Permits
(0-10<16; O-11-17)

‘No building permit shall be issued for the construction of a new structure unless that structure and the
proposed usage are in compliance with the Zoning Code of the City of Bisbee.

7.1.3 . Building Permit Fees
(0-07-14; 0-06-05; 0-03-03: 0-09-05; O-10-03)

The followmq fees and fee schedules shall he appllcable to all projects and lmprovements within
the C|ty of Blsbee for. whlch a. bunlqu permit of anv tvpe is . requ1red and for whlch fees may be
charged tinder any of the respéctive Codes which are adopted in this Chapter.

PERMIT FEES
TOTAL VALUATION FEE
Stoss00_ : s
$501 to $2000 - $24 for the first $500, plus $3 for each
: : ' additional $100 or fractlon thereof
$2001 to $40,000 $69 for the first $2000, plus $11 for .
each additional $1000 or fraction .
thereof.
$40,000 0 $100,000 __ $487forthe frst $40,000, plus $9 for
' : each additional $1000 or fraction
thereof
$100,001 to $500,000 | $1027 for the first $100,000, plus $7.
’ for each additional $1000 or fraction
' thereof
$500,001 to $1,000,000 - L : A . $3, 827 for the first $500, 000 plus $5 _
' . ‘ for each addltlonal $1 000 o fraction . -
thereof '
$1,000,001 to $5,000,000 - . $6327 for the first $1,000,000; plus 3.
‘ - for each additional $1,000. orfractlon R
‘thereof :
$5,000,001 and over ) | $18,327 for the first $5, (00, 000 plus L

$1 for each addltlonal $1, 000 000 or )

frartini Fharanf




For purposes of determining the “Total Valuation” for a project, the following values shall be used: - .

a. New resrdentlal striictures shall: be valued at $73. 00 per square foot.-

b. New. accessorv structures assocrated with residential occupancres, but not intended for .
'resrdentlal use (qarages storage buildings, and similar types. of uses,) shall be valued at L

$36.50 per square foot.

c. _Remodels; additions, and alterations of existing resrdentlal structures shall be valued at the
total cost of all Such work, based on the contract doctiments, or the builder’s estlmates if o

there:is no contract.amount.

d. New commercial structures and- addrt|ons alterations,.and remodels of existing commermal ' »
structures shall be valied baséd on the contract documents for-this work. If theré are‘no- .-
contract documents for_siich work, these valuations shall be based on the most current',

“Burldrng Valuation- Data” available, as provrded bv the Internatronal Code Council. _

e. If the appllcant fails of is unable to provrde a commercrallv reasonable Total Valuation
_.amount for all labor, materlals nd ‘other. costs assomated wrth that prolect for. anyprorect

- other than those. wrth per square foot-values of flat rates established.-in this City Cot

Burlqu Official ay usé thé most current avallable “Burldrnq Valuation- Data” provided: by? - £

the. Internatronal Code Councrl to determrne a Total Valuatron for that prolect

. Total fees for the following. Permlts shall be charqed at the following flat rates, rather than- _

valuies: -
1. 'Electrical service upgrade or replacement (does not mclude Branch Circuit work)'
$55.00 for residential and  $60.00 commercial. -
2. Electric or gas water heaters: $25.00 resrdentral and $30.00 commercral
3. .'Utllltv Clearance lnspectlon (Green Tan):'$ 25.00
. 4, Manufactured Home Installation Permlt $ 200.00

q. Ordlnary repairs to residential structures which involve only the reéplacement of component :
parts of existing work with similar parts or materials and do not exceed $1000 in valuation
(materrals and labor at rarket value) and do not chanqe any. structural electrrcal :

mechanrcal plumbrnq, or fire safety condrtron do not requrre a perm|t and are not subject to - ot

ny fee.

In addition to the fees specrfred above, a Plan Review Fee in the amount -of 65% of the applrcable -

Building Permit Fee will be charged for all permits which require plan review under the appllcable,

Code. The Plan Review Fee shall not be applicable to those permits that are subject to the specified . v

flat rate fees.

These Permlt Feés include one initial mspectron and two (2) re-lnspectrons for each stage of {‘the‘ |
,prolect that doeés -not pass the initial rnspectlon -Additional lnspectlons shall . be ‘subject -
addltronal fée in the amount of $47 00.. lnspectlons durrnq weekends or at t|mes othert an-normal .-

busiriess "hours, when specmcally requested by the owiner or contractor shall be subrect to an S

additional fee of $47.00 per hour, minimum two hours

_Notwrthstandrng any other provision or.law, the Crtv shall. not charge: anv fee for-that portron of u:'

building’ permrt plan review or lnspectron services . that |s assocrated wrth the |nstalla_t|on of a-
p P TR

N R R P T N N N T N R T S T A




convert solar energy to electrical energy or heat.and that will result in a decrease in the productron o |
of global warmmq emissions. This fee exemptron shall only be appllcable to that portlon of :¢ any AN

such permrt directly associated with.the installation of any stich solar device and shall not exempt'
other building components from the qenerally applrcable feés. This fee exemptron shaIl not applv to
the installation -of skyquhts windows .or other means of providing natural I|ghtrng or-fo- bu1ld|ng
deslqns that employ passive solar heatrnq or. coolrng methods for the structure

For work which requires a Building Permit pursuant to the.applicable Code or Codes;-and which is

initiated without obtaining an approprrate Burldrng Permit and without paying. the applicable Permit T

Fee, the cost for the required Building Permit shall be two tlmes (2x) the otherwrse apphcable fee
for that work.

The Building Official may authorlze a refund of the Permit Fees paid by the. applrcant if the. request ,
for the refund is made prror to’ the time at which the Building Official has ‘performed -aiy.Plan

‘Review or other work _on 'the project and ‘the: project is being cancelled For all 6ther. refund'_i____uj B

requests the Building Official shall not authorize the refund. of the. fee, or any portlon of it,
associated Wwith any portlon of the' work which has been performed by the. Burldrnq Official or’his

desrqnee prior. to the receipt of the ‘requést for refund and the notice of the cancellatron of the o

pr0|ect

7.1.4 Conformance to Arizonans with Disabilities Act

Standards and specifications set forth in Title-41, Chapter 9, Article 8, Arizona Revised Statutes (Arizonans . o

with Disabiliies Act), and its implementing rules, including “Americans with Disabilities Act Accessibility
Guidelines for Buildings and Facilities” declared a public record of Resolution No. R-96-46, as applying to

public entities, are hereby adopted and incorporated as an -amendment to the Uniform Building Code . -

adopted by Ordinance 0-94-33 and made a part thereof as tough fully set forth therein. Such standards
and specifications shall apply to new construction and alterations and are not required in buildings or
portions of existing buildings that do not meet the standards and specifications.

Standards and specifications set forth in Title 41, Chapter 9, Article 8, Arizona Revised Statutes (Arizonans :

with' Disabilities Act), and its implementing rules, including “Americans with Disabilities Act Accéssibility
Guidelines for Buildings and Facilities” declared a public record by Résolution No. R- 96-46, as applylng to

public accommodations and commercial facilities, are hereby adopted and incorporated as an amendment' ; -
to the Uniform Buildirig Code adopted by Ordinance 0-94-33 ( Chapter 7; City Code) and made part thereof "

as though fully set forth therein. Such standards and specifications shall apply to new construction and

- alterations commenced after September 3, 1996.



ARTICLE 7.2 PLUMBING CODE
(0-94-33; R-94-50; 0:90-33; R-90-29; 0-88-06)

7.21 Adoption of Code

The 2012 International Plumbing Code, including all tables and appendlxes is hereby adopted for use in -

this jurisdiction except as specifically amended.or excluded by the amendments speclfled in this City - ‘
Code. The 2012 Initernation Plumbing Code, as appllcable in the City of- Blsbee is hereby anerided . -

as follows:

1. | At Section 101.2, number the existing. exceptlon as Exception 1: Exception 2 to. read: ‘

Plumblnq svstems in eXIstlng bulldlnqs underqomq repair,. alteration or .addition, and chanqe of _' L

occupancy. shall be permitted to comply with the Internatlonal Ex1st|nq Building Code.

2. AtSection 106.6.2, insert a reference to the Bmldmg Permit Fees schedule of the City Code _
for the apphcable fee schedule ™ \ e

3. At Section 106.6.3, insert a reference to the permit fee refund authority included with-the .
Building Permit Fee schedule of the City Code '

4. 'At'Section 403.2, in Exceptlon No. 2,-change “15” t0 “50.” Insert a.new Exception No. 4 to""‘ e

read: “In exrstmq bwldlng occupancres one pubhclemployee restroom is aIIowed where ‘the -
occupant load does not exceed 50 for other than M occupancies, and for M occupancresJ where the:
occupant load does not -exceed 100, provrded that the one restroom for all such. occupancres is -
code ‘compliant with ICC A117.1 — 2009. Where it is not technically feasible to comply with the new -
construction standards, the above .shall conform to the requ1rements to the maX|mum extend
feasrble

5. At Section 903.1, insert “6 inches.”

6. At Section 1003 and followmg reqardlnq Grease interceptor requirements, note that the =
exceptlons ‘and protectlons for existing uses as ‘incliided in Section 13.5.2 of the City Code shall"
remain in effect, Upon the adoptron of this International Plumbmg Code, the provisions of this Code - - -
shall replace the provisions of the Uniform Plumbing Code for all purposes, excep as may be .

specmcallv excepted under State or local law.

1. Appendlx B, W|th a 3 inch per hour rainfall rate, is adopted. Appendices C D, E, and F are
informational resources and are adopteéd for that purpose. Appendlx A is not adopted.

' 7722' General Amendments

The Plumblng Code is amended by addlng the followmg - :

A. Any new connections from inflow sources such as flood waters and seepage waters into the sanltary
sewer portion of the City sewer system shall be expressly prohibited.

B. To ensure that new sewers and connections to the City sewer system are properly designied and
constructed. new sewers and connections shall be desianed and constructed .in accordance with the




requirements of the Ariiona Depa‘rtment of Health Services, Cochise County Health Department and - |
the City. -
C. Al wastewater introduced into the treatment works of the City shall not contain toxins or other,f s
pollutants in amounts or concentrations that- endanger public safety and physical integrity of- the
treatment works, or cause violation of effluent or water quality lrmltatlons or preclude the selectron of
the most cost—effectrve aIternatrve for wastewater treatment and sludge drsposal '

7.2.3. Water Conservation Requirements.

The following water saving requirements are mtended to be applied in connect|on w1th the
provisions of the adopted Plumbing Code and shall be applrcable to all new construction and to

_that portion of any remodeled or retrofitted commercial construction which includes any substant|alw_}‘_-l‘.“ o

replacement or remodelrng of the systems or fixtures described in this Arficle.

A. Plumbing Standards -

1. Hot water pipes, |ncIud|ng those in any recirculation system, shall be rnsulated wrth a"_l_‘

minimum theérmal resistance (R- value) of R4,

2. Hot water systems shall be designed and shall include such components as may be
necessary to deliver hot water at each demand point with no more than-0.6 gallons (2.3
liters) of water delivered prior to the delivery of hot water.

3. All new single family resrdentral construction shall include plumbing features that will be
readily adaptable accessrble and cIearIy marked to allow for the optional 1 use ‘of the “gray -

water’ (aka “greywater’) to be produced by the residents, to be used &s a source for -

outdoor irfigation, in the manner allowed by applicable law. ,
4. Water service pressure at the point of delivery for residential occupancres shall not exceed o

60 pounds per square inch (psi). The Building Inspector is authorized to allow exceptions™

where circumstances beyond the control of the property owner may require a hlgher limit.

B. Plumbing Fixture Standards

Except as otherwise noted, the following designated plumbing fixtures and applrances shall -
either be “WaterSense” Iabeled fixtures, or.shall meet or exceed the water conservatron“l. o

standard established for these types of fixtures through : the “WaterSense program.
© "WaterSense” is a program established by the U.S. Environmental Protéction Agency which,

among other matters, establishes criteria for water-efficient plumbing frxtures and marntalnsf S
listings through the EPA website of the designated criteria and approved fixtures. For proposed- - .
fixtures or appliances which do not include the "WaterSense label, the property OWneér or-:

contractor shall have the oblrgatron of demonstratrng that the proposed -fi fixtiire ‘meets- or

exceeds these requrrements (Where ﬂow rates ‘are prowded rn parentheses these represent;} o

BLA S b r© i e g e v nffmronmnc Ara irmaravan \



oo

10.

Toilets (1.28 gallons per flush- gpf)

Flushing urinals (only for.custodial cleaning) or non-water using units.
Battiroom sink faucets-and faucet accessories. (1 Sgpm)
Kitchen sink faucets and accessories (2. 2 gpm max.).

Showerheads, single units. '

- For shower compartments with multiple outlet units, including body sprays, rain systems, - 3 3
waterfalls, and jets, the total flow rate of water from all such outlets into the compartment' e

shall not exceed 2.0 gpm.
Residential clothes washers, Energy Star qualified with a water factor equal or less than - .
6.0 gallons of water per-cycle per cubic foot of capacity. ‘
Commercial-laundry facilities, mcludrng for-fee washing machines available to the public or

residents of a multifamily housing development, Energy Star qualified with a Water factor of

4.5 gallons per cubic foot of capacity, or less.

Evaporative_cooling systems for single family residences shall use a maximum of 35_,;: -._."-'1',__'

gallons (13 3 liters) of water per ton- hourcoollng ‘when adjusted to maximum water use.
Water softener systems shall be certified to meet the standards of NSF/ANSI 44,
Residéntial Cation Exchang Water Softeners, 2, including the efﬂcrency ratlngs standards‘
in Section 7.

_Dnnklng water treatment systems must ‘be certified to yield at least 85 gallons of treated.-'.' o y

water for each 100 gallons of water processed

C. Prohibited Plumbing Fixtures

The followrng designated types of plumbing fixtures and systems shall not be permltted in
connection with any new or remodeled commercial or multi-family building or other facifity. For
purposes of this restriction, a “remodeled commercial or multifamily building of facility” would
include any such structure or improvement in which these designated types of plumbing
fixtures and systems were not already in place. '

1.
2

3.

ARTICLE 7.3

Outdoor air-cooling misters which release water or water vapor, reducing the apparent -
ambient temperature in that location. _
Commercial car washing facilities, including dealerships, which do not mclude systems

which recycle a minimum of seventy-five percent (75%) of the water used in the system

Watering or irrigation systems that do not include rainfall shutoff devices, or other.

mechanisms that reduce or interrupt the delivery of water during effective rain evenits.

ELECTRICAL CODE

(0-94-33; R-94-50; 0-90-33; R-90-29)

7.34 Ad"o’ption of Code

The 2014 National Electric Code, including all tables and appendixes, is hereby adopted tor use in thrs} h

jurisdiction -except as specrfrcallv amended or excluded by the amendments specrfled in thrs Cit J

Code




7.3.2 Amendments

The 2014 National Electric Code as. applicable in the City of Bisbee, is hereby ame'nded,as folloWs:

1. Artlcle 210.8 (A)(5). Amend fo read: “All 125-volt single phase,. 15- and . 20- ampere
receptacles. installed_in_ground level rooms and unflnlshed ‘basements_shall_have qround-fault_l"'
crrcurt-rnterrupter protectlon for personnel For | purposes of this: sectron ground level rooms nd"
unfinished basements are defined-as areas not mtended as habitable roomis and limited to storage
areas, work areas, and the like.” (The éxception shaII remain unchanqed)

2. Artrcle 210.8 (B)(3). Amend to ‘read: “Rooftops. The receptacle(s) shall have the reset’
located.on the roof.”

3. Article 210.71. Power Source. Amend by adding this new Section: *Where required, smoke - -

“alarms shall .not be mstalled on a dedlcated C|rcurt and shall orlgrnate from a qeneral purpose‘fﬂ"fw,:":fl""f" '

'branch cucmt Y

4, Article 230.6. Amend by adding the following: “A recessed service entry is not permitted.” . '

5. .Article 230 70. Amend by addlng the followrnq after the frrst paragraph: “Service . -
dlsconnectrnq means and risers shall be surface mounted g -

6. Article 250.50. Amend by adding the following: “All accessory structures with a poured

foundation require the installation of a concrete-encased electrode as required by NEC 250.52 (A)(3)

and IRC Section E3508. 1 2.7

1. _Article 300.21. Amend by adding the following: “Penetrations of one- hour fire-resistance- - o

rated walls shall requrre approved metallic raceway with 12-inch extensions on ‘both sides of the
wall. The: penetratrons of the wall and the ‘conduit ends shall be fire safe.. Penetratrons of two-hour,
or qreater fire-resistance-rated walls shall’ requrre approved metallic raceway ‘With 5-foot
extensions on both sides of the wall. The penetrations of the wall and the conduit énds shall be frre' )
safe.” -

8. Article 406. Amend. bv adding a new sub Article, Article 406.4 (A)(1) Installation, to read as
follows: “When installed in a vertical posrtron qroundlng type rece Jtacles shall be mstalled with -

the grotinding contacts down. When installed i in the horizontal position, qroundrng Jpe receptacles [ 1

shall be mstalled with the qroundmg contacts on the rrqht v

9. Artlcle 408. Amend by adding a new sub Article 408.31; Subpanels and Low-VoItaqe Boxes, S
to read as follows: “Subpanels and low-voltage boxes shall not be located in -ariy firewall, fire -~
barrrer fire partrtron or.in the qaraqe side of the common wall separatlng the dwellmq from- a':’. _f _
qaraqe or. carport Subpanels and low-voltaqe boxes may.be surface. mounted on anv of the above- N )
Amentloned walls.”




ARTICLE 7.4 FIRE CODE

7.44  Adoption of Code
(0-03-03; 0-94-33; R-94-50)

The 2012 Internatronal Flre Code, including all tables and appendlxes is hereby adopted for use in this |
jurisdiction except as specmcally amended or excluded by. the amendments specified: in this- Cltv ;
Code. The 2012 Internatlonal Fire Code as appllcable in the Crty of Blsbee is héreby amended as
foIIows ' ‘

-

1. At Section 102.3, insert “or’ the Internatlonal Existing Burldrnq Code” after “Internatlonal |
Bmldrnq Code” (at two locations). :

2. The provisions of Article 4.3 of the City Code, Fire Flow, Water :Main and Fire Hydrant

Spacing Requrrements shell be applrcable where there is anv conflrct wrth the provrsrons of the o o
" International Fire Code. - R

3. Appendices B, C, D, E, F, G, H, and | are adopted. Appendices A and J are not adopted.

ARTICLE 7.5 MECHANICAL CODE
(0-03-03; 0-94-33; R-94-50; 0-90-33; R-90-29; 0-88-06)

7.51 Adoption of Code

The 2012 International Mechanical Code, including all tables and appendixes, is hereby adopted for use in
this jurisdiction_except as specifically amended or excluded by the amendments specified in this City
Code. The 2012 International Mechanical Code, as applicable in the City of Bisbee, .is heretlv‘
amended as follows:

1. At Section 101.2, number the existing exception as Exception 1. Add Exception 2, to read:
Mechanical systems in existing buildings undergoing repair, alteration, or-addition, or. change of
occupancy shall be permittéd to comply with the International Existing Building Code.

2. At Section 106.5.2, insert reference to the Buﬂdlnq Permit Fees schedule of the Crty Code
for the appllcable fee schedule. '

3 At Section 1 06 5.3, Insert reference to the permlt fee refund authority rncluded wrth the
Building Permrt Fee schedule of the City Code

4, Apbendix A is adopted. Appendix B is not adopted.




ARTICLE 7.6 DANGEROUSBUILDING CODE
(0-03-03; 0-94-33; R-94-50)

7.6.1 Adoption of Code
The 1997 Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, plus changes from prior uniform codes‘,

for abatement of dangerous buildings, and as prepared by the International ‘Conferefice of Bmldmg N
Officials, is heréby adopted in its eritirety as if fully set out in this ordinance, except Sections 205.1 and

205.2 of the 1997 Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Bu1ld|ngs pertaining to a Board of -

Appeals, in accordance with A.R.S. Section 9-802.

ARTICLE 7.7 ADDITIONAL CODES
(0-94-33; R-94-50)

7.7.1  Adoption of Codes

The 2012 International Fuel Gas Code, the 2012 Energy Conservation Code, and the 2012 International .-

Property Maintenance Code, including all tables and appendixes,.are hereby adopted for use in this
jurisdiction ‘except as specifically amended or excluded by the amendments specnfled in thls CltV .
Code '

7.7.2 Amendments to the International Fuel Gas Code

The 2012 International Fuel Gas Code, as applicable in the City of Bisbee, is hereby amended as -
follows:

1. At Sectlon 101.2, number the existing exception as Exception 1 and add Exceptlon 2, to |

read as follows: “As an alternative to the provisions of this code, fuel gas piping systems, fuel- -gas .
utilization equment and related accessones inexisting buildings undergomq repalr alteration, or -

addition, and change of occupancy shall be permitted ‘to comply with the International Ex15tmg K 7

Building Code.”

2, At Section 106.6.2, add: “City of Bisbee building permit fees shall be as established in the
City Code. :

3. At Section 106.6.3, add: “Permit fee refund process shall be as established in the City . -
Code.”

4. _At Section 303.7, insert new subsectlon 303.7.1 to read: “Liquefied petroleum gas piping
shall not serve any gas appliance located in a pit or basement where heavier- than -air qas might
collect to form a flammable mixtuire.” : )

‘5. Appendices A, B, C, and D are adopted.




7.7. 3 Am‘endﬁients"to-the 'lnternétibnal E'nergy 'Con‘servation:Code

The 2012 Internatlonal Energy Conservatlon Code, as appllcable in the City of: Blsbee s herebv '; o

amended as follows '

1. The Residential Provisions, pages R: through R-42, in‘c‘iu'sive, are riot adopted. -

1.74 Amendments to the International Property Maintenance Code

The 2012 Internatlonal Property Malntenance Code, as appllcable in the City of Bisbée, .is hereby'
amended as foIlows

1. " At Section 302 4, riote that the control of weeds and planit Growith is siibject to City of Blsbee e

City Code Artlcle 9.4.4; wh|ch shall be. the: appllcable standard.

2. - At Sectlon 302.8, deletethlsSectlon

3. At Sectlon 303, chanqe all teferences to'the height of fences and barriers from 48 mches”ff“ ) Bems

to “60 mcheS '

4. At Section 5033, delete this Section.

5, At Section 704.1.1, delete this SectionJ

6. Appendix A is.adopted. -



